

89726

OFFICE OF  
Indian Affairs

Rec. NOV 8

1905

123 <sup>11</sup>/<sub>9</sub>

Indian School, Carlisle, Pa.,  
Nov. 7, 1905.

J.R. Wise,  
Acting Supt.

Incloses lists of harness, leather  
shoe findings, etc. corrected by  
M.I. Ziegler.

2 Inclosures.

*File*

7

File

*Seater*

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR  
UNITED STATES INDIAN SERVICE  
INDIAN INDUSTRIAL SCHOOL  
CARLISLE, PENNA.

Nov. 7, 1905.

To the Honorable,

The Commissioner of Indian Affairs,  
Washington, D. C.

Sir:

Referring to Office letter "Finance" dated the 1st instant relative to changes and suggestions looking to improvement in the matter of purchasing harness, leather, shoe findings, saddlery, etc., you are advised that the lists inclosed were submitted to Mr. M. I. Ziegler, harness maker at this school, with directions to go over the matter with great care and suggest such changes, eliminations and additions in the lists as he might deem desirable. He was also directed to confer with the shoemaker and secure from him such suggestions and changes as might be deemed valuable.

I now return herewith the lists referred to with the revisions noted therein as above indicated by Mr. Ziegler. The matter has been gone into, I think, with care and the suggestions made will, if adopted, result I am sure in an improvement in the letting of contracts for supplies in the special lines named.. In connection with the lists there is also inclosed a memorandum by Mr. Ziegler in reference to shoemaker's tools and also in reference to proposals for leather samples, which may contain some suggestions of use.

In submitting these Mr. Ziegler suggests that attention be invited to his letter to you dated October 13, 1905, in connection with the letter from Mr. James T. Edworthy of Riggs Institute

relative to harness, leather and shoe findings..

We have no suggestions to offer in connection with this subject other than those set forth in the lists submitted by Mr. Ziegler which, I think, cover the subject fully so far as the experience of this school is concerned.

Very respectfully,

*J. R. Mice*

Acting Superintendent.

JRW-S

Inclosures.

M.I.N.

boot trees and pegs, peg files and peg cutters.

shape them. You can do as you think best, either carry or drop who wants a hand made pair of boots, then they must have a tree to rolling. Boot trees are very rarely used, only when they get a man so far as new work is concerned; mostly in very rough and heavy half either new or repairing. There is very little peg work done now.

Peg cutters and peg levers are only used where they do peg work, of tools is required for hand work.

quite different machines to do the same work with. The above list where they manufacture boots and shoes by machinery they have tools carried on the annual list.

fact that they do not wear out so fast as some of the other shoemaker The reason that they are not called for often is due to the

Wheels, lugs  
Wheels box with slides  
Sticks, size  
Sticks, shoulder  
Sticks, long  
Pinchers, sawing  
Wrist hook sets, foot power  
Wrist sets, foot power  
Crimping borers  
Crimping boards, boys  
Crimping boards, men  
Collars  
Clamps, sewing jaws

only used by bench shoemakers on custom hand work:

following list of shoemaker's tools are still in the market

Indian Office,

Incl. No. 7

1905

89726

There should be furnished for samples, of the following kinds of leathers, not less than one side, or full skin, as the case may be.

Not Oak. Harness

Oak. Sole,

Hoemlock, sole,

Oak. Raps,

Oak. Calf skins,

Glazed Dongola Kid.

Shell Dongola Kid

Cr Russat Sheep skins,

Cr Pink Sheep skins,

Cr Leacing Leather,

Crimping boards, boys

Crimping screws

Eylet sets, foot power

Eylet hook sets, foot power

Pinchers, lasting

Sticks, long

Sticks, shoulder

Sticks, size

Wheeles box with slide

Wheeles fudge

The fol

and are only

still in the market

and work:

The reason that they are not called for oftener is due to the fact that they do not wear out so fast as some of the other shoemaker tools carried on the annual list.

Where they manufacture boots and shoes by machinery they have quite different machines to do the same work with. The above list of tools is required for hand work.

Peg cutters and peg rasps are only used where they do peg work, either new or repairing. There is very little peg work done now, so far as new work is concerned; mostly in very rough and heavy half soling. Boot trees are very rarely used, only when they get a man who wants a hand made pair of boots, then they must have a tree to shape them. You can do as you think best, either carry or drop boot trees and pegs, peg files and peg cutters.

M.I.Z.

20350  
1002  
The following list of shoemaker's tools are still in the market and are only used by bench shoemakers on custom hand work:

Clamps, sewing knee  
Collices  
Crimping boards, men  
Crimping boards, boys  
Crimping screws  
Eylet sets, foot power  
Eylet hook sets, foot power  
Pinchers, lasting  
Sticks, long  
Sticks, shoulder  
Sticks, size  
Wheeles box with slide  
Wheeles fudge

The reason that they are not called for oftener is due to the fact that they do not wear out so fast as some of the other shoemaker tools carried on the annual list.

Where they manufacture boots and shoes by machinery they have quite different machines to do the same work with. The above list of tools is required for hand work.

Peg cutters and peg rasps are only used where they do peg work, either new or repairing. There is very little peg work done now, so far as new work is concerned; mostly in very rough and heavy half soling. Boot trees are very rarely used, only when they get a man who wants a hand made pair of boots, then they must have a tree to shape them. You can do as you think best, either carry or drop boot trees and pegs, peg files and peg cutters.

M.I.Z.







SAMPLES OF INFERIOR GOODS WILL NOT BE CONSIDERED.

G-535

QUANTITY REQUIRED.	CLASS No. 11—HARNESS, LEATHER, SHOE FINDINGS, SADDLERY, Etc.—Continued. Deliverable packed in quantities as required.	QUANTITY OFFERED.	SAMPLES.						
			No. 1. Price.	No. 2. Price.	No. 3. Price.	No. 4. Price.	No. 5. Price.	No. 6. Price.	
142 no.	Collars, horse, 19½ to 21 inches, by half inch. <i>imitation Scotch Thong sewed</i>								
33 no.	Collars, horse, 21½ to 24 inches, by half inch. <i>imitation Scotch Thong sewed</i>								
89 no.	Collars, mule, 15 to 16½ inches, by half inch. <i>imitation Scotch Thong sewed</i>								
14 no.	Collicies, sizes 4 to 12.								
1 pair	Crimping boards, boys'								
2 pairs	Crimping boards, men's,								
2 no.	Crimping screws,								
33 doz.	Currycombs, tinned iron, 8 bars,								
4 no.	Cutters, peg. <del>regular</del> <i>double, cast steel.</i>								
335 doz.	Dressing shoe,								
X	<i>Eyelet black, vs. 11, long, men's and boys. J. C. B. &amp; Co. brand</i>								
41 M	Eyelets, black, B. long, <i>women's and missie.</i>								
16 M	Eyelet hooks, black, <i>N<sup>o</sup>. 1 - boot lacing</i>								
7 no.	Eyelet sets, hand, <i>with spring</i>								
1 no.	Eyelet set, foot power,								
3 no.	Eyelet hook sets, foot power,								
203 no.	Halters, <i>all leather, 5 rings, Buckle chin strap 6 foot lead, 1/8 inch wide</i>								
70 lbs.	Hair, gray goat,								
440 pairs	Hames, Concord, size 18 by <del>20</del> <sup>22</sup> inches, <i>wood high top, clip and breast ring.</i>								
111 sets	*Harness, double, complete, with breeching, Concord hames.								
7 sets	*Harness, double, complete, without breeching, Concord hames.								
6 sets	Harness, plow, double, with backband and collars, Concord hames.								
6 doz.	Hooks, hames,								
40 doz.	Ink, burnishing (quarts),								
9 no.	Jacks, <sup>crispin</sup> lhw-arm, for lasting and pegging,								
17 doz.	Knives, cutting, <sup>patent</sup> blades, to fit patent handles,								
1 doz.	Knives, <sup>patent</sup> blades, to fit patent handles,								
1 doz.	Knives, <del>shoe</del> draw, gauge brake, with guard <sup>patent</sup> grip								
1 doz.	Knives, head, <del>shoe</del> , 4½" oval handles.								
1 doz.	Knives, round, large size, 6 inches oval handles, good steel								
50 doz.	Knives, shoe, square point, <del>shoe</del> paring, 4 inch blade, good steel.								
5 doz.	Knives, skiving, regular, 6 inch blade, round point.								
2 no.	Knives, splitting, 10-inch, iron frame, new pattern, # 86								

*wood high top, solid steel back, 1 inch hole, hold back plate, and trimmings.*

*No-6 concord hame, wood high top, solid steel back, 1-in hame strap, hold back plate, size 18 by 22 inches 1/4 inch turn back strap, 2 eyes 1 inch wide 1.5 feet long, billets and buckle, and snaps x 6 Champion.*

*The description is all right and the jack is a very useful machine where a <sup>reformation</sup> is up to date, it saves the pieces from being gamed. one can clamp up to work on a jack of this kind*





SAMPLES OF INFERIOR GOODS WILL NOT BE CONSIDERED.

6-200

QUANTITY REQUIRED.	CLASS No. 11—HARNESS, LEATHER, SHOE FINDINGS, SADDLERY, ETC.—Continued. Deliverable packed in quantities as required.	QUANTITY OFFERED.	SAMPLES.							
			No. 1. Price.	No. 2. Price.	No. 3. Price.	No. 4. Price.	No. 5. Price.	No. 6. Price.		
6 no.	Sticks, size,									
16 pairs	Stirrups, wood, 5-inch,									
4 no.	Stitching horses, 5 inch jaws, good solid frame.									
93 no.	Stones, sand,									
7 no.	Stretchers, instep, <i>bronzed iron nos. 1 &amp; 2</i>									
14 no.	Stretchers, toe, <i>bronzed iron nos. 1-2 &amp; 3</i>									
18 no.	Surcingles, <i>3 1/2 inches wide, 6 ft. 9 inches long made up, Billet 1 1/4 in by 1 1/2 in good stout webbing</i>									
3 doz.	Swivels, bridle, X. C., loop, 3/8-inch,									
3 doz.	Swivels, bridle, X. C., loop, 1/2-inch,									
415 lbs.	Tacks, shoe, 1, 2, and 3 ounce, <i>extra swedes, lasting.</i>									
6 1/2 doz.	Terrets, band, X. C., 1 1/2-inch,									
2 doz.	Terrets, band, X. C., 1 1/8-inch,									
1 lb.	Thread, harness, Barbour's, # 3. black.									
115 lbs.	Thread, shoe, Barbour's, No. 3, <i>white</i>									
40 doz.	Thread, linen, spools, black, machine, <i>3 cord 2-3 spools Barbour's best</i> Nos. <del>40 and 50</del> <i>18-40 and 50</i>									
9 no.	Ticklers, <i>single octagon</i> Nos. 1-1-2-3 & 4.									
3 no.	<i>#24 1/2</i> <del>Ticklers</del> <i>layers, edge creasers, octagon.</i> Nos. 1-2-3-4-5									
7 no.	Tools, claw, # 123 - <i>extra heavy-wetted handle</i>									
42 doz.	Trace carriers X. C., <i>Raynolds Pat. 1 1/4 inch</i> <i>Raynolds Pat. 1 1/2 inch.</i>									
24 no.	Trees, self-adjusting, X. C.,									
102 <del>balls</del>	<i>Wax saddler's black small balls per 100-balls Summer temperature</i>									
2,020 balls	<i>Wax, saddler's, black, small balls per 100-balls Winter temperature</i> <i>Wax shoemaker's <del>black</del> <i>brown</i> small balls, per 100-balls, Summer temperature.</i> <i>Wax, shoemaker's, small ball, per 100-balls, Winter temperature.</i>									
5 no.	Wheels, box, with slide,									
1 no.	Wheel, fudge,									
31 no.	Wheels, overstretch, with carriage, Nos. 6, 7, 8, 10, 12, and 14, <i>stationary octagon</i>									
19 doz.	Winkers, 3/8-inch, sensible, 2 seams, patent leather.									
5 doz.	<i>Saddlers steel compasses nos. 5-6-7- and 8 inches.</i>									
1 lb.	<i>Saddlers bag or buckle tongue puncher size 5 1/2 - 7 1/2 - 1 - 1 1/8 - 1 1/4 - 1 1/2 in</i>									
155 lbs.	Thread, shoe, Barbour's, No. 10, <b>ADDITIONAL ARTICLES.</b>									
3 doz.	<i>Weld fast wire clinching nails. sizes 7-8 1/2-8 1/4   4 1/2-8   5 1/2-8   6 1/2-8</i>									
3 doz.	<i>Smells heel chavon iron frame nos. 3-6-7-8-9-10.</i>									
doz.	<i>Walt Timpf good steel</i>									
doz.	CLASS No. 12—AGRICULTURAL IMPLEMENTS, ETC.									
doz.	Deliverable packed in quantities as required.									
40 doz.	Augers, post-hole, 9-inch,									
40 doz.	A No grease (2 doz. boxes in case),									

Black heel ball in c alkes  
 Steel shoe hammers nos 0-1-2-3-4  
 Blotter needles sizes 1-3-5-6-7-  
 Roller trace buckles malleable nos 6 1/2 inch  
 Roller trace buckles malleable nos 6 1/2 inch  
 Channel cement in 1 and 8 gallon cans  
 Shoemakers bright steel nippers, extra forged  
 Pulverized soapstone  
 Saddlers steel plyers, bevel nose, 7 inches long  
 Malleable clout nails 3/4 to one inch sizes

SAMPLES OF INFERIOR GOODS WILL NOT BE CONSIDERED.

6-805

QUANTITY REQUIRED.	CLASS No. 10—FURNITURE AND WOODEN WARE—Continued. Deliverable packed in quantities as required.	QUANTITY OFFERED.	SAMPLES.						
			No. 1. Price.	No. 2. Price.	No. 3. Price.	No. 4. Price.	No. 5. Price.	No. 6. Price.	
850 no.	Washboards, double zinc, in bundles of one dozen, with 2 cleats 2 x 3/8 inch each side of bundle.								
142 no.	Washstands, wood, papered and crated, not over 4 in one crate.								
160 no.	Washing machines, extra heavy, well crated (bids on light machines will not be considered).								
44 no.	Washtubs, three hoops, in nests of the three largest sizes.								
215 no.	Wringers, clothes, wood frame; rolls 12 x 1 1/4 inches.								
30 no.	Wringers, clothes, wood frame; rolls 10 x 1 1/4 inches. See also Class 17—Hardware.								
	CLASS No. 11—HARNESS, LEATHER, SHOE FINDINGS, SADDLERY, Etc. Deliverable packed in quantities as required.								
8 doz.	Awl hafts, patent, pegging,	.40							
21 doz.	Awl hafts, patent, sewing, harness -	3.85							
88 doz.	Awls, patent, pegging, assorted,	.56							
78 doz.	Awls, patent, sewing, assorted,	.06							
3 1/2 doz.	Awls, round, with handle,	2.55							
146 doz.	Awls, saddler's, assorted,	.14							
95 doz.	Bits, loose ring, snaffle, X. C., 2 1/2-inch, jointed.	.88							
17 doz.	Bits, loose ring, snaffle, X. C., 2 1/2-inch, stiff.	.88							
9,100 boxes.	Blacking, shoe,	3.94							
205 no.	Blankets, horse,	.97							
1 no.	Boottree, <i>No bid rec'd for this for several years. Why leave it on.</i>								
29 no.	Bridles, riding,	1.00							
19 oz.	Bristles,	.70							
272 no.	Brooms, stable,	.46							
208 no.	Brushes, horse, leather backs,	20.40							
138 doz.	Buckles, breast strap, snaps and buckles, malleable iron, X. C., 1 1/2-inch.	.58							
19 gross	Buckles, bar rein, malleable iron, X. C., 3/8-inch.	.65							
23 gross	Buckles, bar rein, malleable iron, X. C., 1/2-inch.	.88							
17 gross	Buckles, bar rein, malleable iron, X. C., 5/8-inch.	1.00							
20 gross	Buckles, bar rein, malleable iron, X. C., 1-inch.	1.26							
9 gross	Buckles, harness, sensible, malleable iron, X. C., 3/8-inch.	.43							
18 gross	Buckles, harness, sensible, malleable iron, X. C., 1/2-inch.	.56							

Quantity carried for this year.

*I think this list was made up after consultation with Carlisle a number of years ago*

Price paid

*It is thought that perhaps the description of some of these shoe findings & harness findings are so indefinite that agents and Superintendents do not know what to estimate for them. If so please make them clearer.*

SAMPLES OF INFERIOR GOODS WILL NOT BE CONSIDERED.

6-895

QUANTITY REQUIRED.	CLASS No. 11—HARNESS, LEATHER, SHOE FINDINGS, SADDLERY, ETC.—Continued. Deliverable packed in quantities as required.	QUANTITY OFFERED.	SAMPLES.						
			No. 1. Price.	No. 2. Price.	No. 3. Price.	No. 4. Price.	No. 5. Price.	No. 6. Price.	
10 gross	Buckles, harness, sensible, malleable iron, X. C., $\frac{3}{8}$ -inch.	78							
16 gross	Buckles, harness, sensible, malleable iron, X. C., 1-inch.	99							
18 gross	Buckles, harness, sensible, malleable iron, X. C., $1\frac{1}{4}$ inch.	162							
10 gross	Buckles, harness, sensible, malleable iron, X. C., $1\frac{1}{2}$ -inch.	205							
7 gross	Buckles, roller, girth, malleable iron, X. C., $1\frac{1}{2}$ -inch.	130							
13 gross	Buckles, roller, harness, malleable iron, X. C., $\frac{3}{8}$ -inch.	45							
19 gross	Buckles, roller, harness, malleable iron, X. C., $\frac{3}{8}$ -inch.	54							
33 gross	Buckles, roller, harness, malleable iron, X. C., $\frac{3}{8}$ -inch.	63							
32 gross	Buckles, roller, harness, malleable iron, X. C., 1-inch.	71							
21 gross	Buckles, roller, harness, malleable iron, X. C., $1\frac{1}{4}$ -inch.	103							
14 gross	Buckles, roller, harness, malleable iron, X. C., $1\frac{1}{2}$ -inch.	130							
9 gross	Buckles, roller, harness, malleable iron, X. C., $1\frac{3}{4}$ -inch.	157							
5 gross	Buckles, roller, harness, malleable iron, X. C., 2-inch.	184							
6 doz. pairs	Buckles, trace, $1\frac{1}{4}$ -inch, 3-loop, Cham- pion, X. C.	56							
113 doz. pairs	Buckles, trace, $1\frac{1}{2}$ -inch, 3-loop, Cham- pion, X. C.	65							
8 doz. pairs	Buckles, trace, $1\frac{3}{4}$ -inch, 3-loop, Cham- pion, X. C.	72							
6 doz. pairs	Buckles, trace, 2-inch, 3-loop, Champion, X. C.	92							
4. 2. 4 no.	Burnishers, heel, corrugated,	40							
9. 2. 6 no.	Burnishers, heel, plain,	25							
9 4. 3 no.	Burnishers, shank,	40							
28 doz.	Cement, shoe, 2-oz.,	74							
92 no.	Chains, halter, with snap, $4\frac{1}{2}$ feet, No. 0,	13							
2. 9. 5 no.	Channel cutters,	50							
3 2. 5 no.	Channel openers,	15							
54 no.	Cinchas,	25							
8 no.	Clamps, sewing, knee,	<i>To Bid this year Before we paid 1.50</i>							
65 doz.	Clips, hame, japanned,	20							
74 doz.	Clips, trace, polished, $4\frac{1}{2}$ -inch, malleable iron.	12							
30 doz.	Cockeyes, screwed, japanned, $1\frac{1}{4}$ -inch,	16							
174 doz.	Cockeyes, screwed, japanned, $1\frac{1}{2}$ -inch,	19							
43 doz.	Cockeyes, screwed, japanned, $1\frac{3}{4}$ -inch,	23							
18 doz.	Cockeyes, screwed, japanned, 2-inch,	30							
224 no.	Collars, horse, 17 to 19 inches, by half inch.	151							

SAMPLES OF INFERIOR GOODS WILL NOT BE CONSIDERED.

6-305

QUANTITY REQUIRED.	CLASS No. 11—HARNES, LEATHER, SHOE FINDINGS, SADDLERY, ETC.—Continued. Deliverable packed in quantities as required.	QUANTITY OFFERED.	SAMPLES.					
			No. 1. Price.	No. 2. Price.	No. 3. Price.	No. 4. Price.	No. 5. Price.	No. 6. Price.
142 no.	Collars, horse, 19½ to 21 inches, by half inch.	155						
1904, 1905, 33 no.	Collars, horse, 21½ to 24 inches, by half inch.	163						
89 no.	Collars, mule, 15 to 16½ inches, by half inch.	141						
18 1. 14 no.	Collices, sizes 4 to 12,	<i>No bids received this year, and for several years have had no bid for most of them. In fact they are seldom called for.</i>						
1. 1. 1 pair	Crimping boards, boys'							
1. 1. 2 pairs	Crimping boards, men's							
2. 2. 2 no.	Crimping screws,							
33 doz.	Currycombs, tinned iron, 8 bars,	105						
3 4. 4 no.	Cutters, peg, regular,	No Bid rec'd. Price we paid 105¢						
335 doz.	Dressing, shoe,	50						
41 M	Eyelets, black, B, long,	<i>There is some complaint that the eyelets we bought this year were too small for the laces and a sample was sent to the office. It is suggested they should be #9</i>				08		
16 M	Eyelet hooks, black,		70					
7 no.	Eyelet sets, hand,	40						
1. 1. 1 no.	Eyelet set, foot power,	<i>No Bid for several years and seldom called for</i>						
4 2. 3 no.	Eyelet hook sets, foot power,							
203 no.	Halters,	88						
70 lbs.	Hair, gray goat,	07						
440 pairs	Hames, Concord, size 18 by 20 inches, wood, high top, clip and breast ring.	46						
111 sets	*Harness, double, complete, with breeching, Concord hames.	2275						
7 sets	*Harness, double, complete, without breeching, Concord hames.							
6 sets	Harness, plow, double, with backband and collars, Concord hames.	1450						
6 doz.	Hooks, hames,	33						
40 doz.	Ink, burnishing (quarts),	125						
11. 5. 9 no.	Jacks, low-arm, for lasting and pegging,	No bid this year. We never got a bid before.						
17 doz.	Knives, cutting,	No Bid. Perhaps description is not clear enough such as size						
1½ doz.	Knives, gauge,	1775						
1 doz.	Knives, head, large size,	10.50						
1½ doz.	Knives, round, large size,	19.00						
50 doz.	Knives, shoe, square point, No. 3,	75						
5 doz.	Knives, skiving, regular,	135						
2 no.	Knives, splitting, 10-inch,	5.00						

## SCHEDULE—Continued.

SAMPLES OF INFERIOR GOODS WILL NOT BE CONSIDERED.

6-885

QUANTITY REQUIRED.	CLASS No. 11—HARNESS, LEATHER, SHOE FINDINGS, SADDLERY, ETC.—Continued. Deliverable packed in quantities as required.	QUANTITY OFFERED.	SAMPLES.						
			No. 1. Price.	No. 2. Price.	No. 3. Price.	No. 4. Price.	No. 5. Price.	No. 6. Price.	
5 doz.	Knives, straight, shoemaker's,	2.75							
232 gross	Laces, shoe, leather, 36-inch,	2.00							
840 gross	Laces, shoe, tubular, 36-inch, black, extra heavy.	.44							
8 no.	Lamps, kit,	50							
5 no.	Last hooks,	11							
4 no.	Lasters, shank, crab,	<i>No bid this year. Before we paid 20¢.</i>							
41 pairs	Lasts, boys', assorted, iron bottoms, 1 to 5,	.80							
43 pairs	Lasts, men's, assorted, iron bottoms, 6 to 10.	.80							
26 pairs	Lasts, misses', assorted, iron bottoms, 13 to 2.	.80							
36 pairs	Lasts, women's, assorted, iron bottoms, 3 to 8.	.80							
38 no.	Lasts, lap, iron, 3 sizes,	25 20 35							
210 lbs.	Leather, Dongola, kid,	.78							
1,110 lbs.	Leather, calfskin,	.57							
30,300 lbs.	Leather, harness (15 to 22 lbs. per side),	33½							
1,235 lbs.	Leather, kip (about 5-lb. sides),	49							
56 sides	Leather, lace, per lb.	40							
5,190 lbs.	Leather, sole, hemlock,	26							
7,055 lbs.	Leather, sole, oak,	32							
785 yds.	Lining, shoe,	15							
135 doz.	Needles, harness, assorted, 4, 5, and 8,	13							
124 lbs.	Nails, saddle,	13							
106 lbs.	Nails, iron, Swede, ¼-14,	} 04½							
195 lbs.	Nails, iron, Swede, ⅜-16,								
167 lbs.	Nails, iron, Swede, ½-16,								
208 lbs.	Nails, iron, Swede, ⅝-14,								
160 galls.	Oil, neatsfoot, in <sup>and 5 gal.</sup> <del>tin</del> cans, cased. Sample of at least 8 ounces required.	54							
1 gross	Ornaments, nickel, 1-inch,	.05							
2⅞ gross	Pad hooks, band, X. C.,	7.00							
5⅝ gross	Pad screws, X. C.,	7.5							
60 lbs.	Paste, Austrian,	16½							
6 galls.	Pegs, shoe, 3-14,	} <i>No bid rec'd this year. Before we paid 20¢.</i> <i>Are they used any more?</i>							
6½ galls.	Pegs, shoe, 4-12,								
6½ galls.	Pegs, shoe, 5-12,								
5½ galls.	Pegs, shoe, 6-11,								



SAMPLES OF INFERIOR GOODS WILL NOT BE CONSIDERED.

QUANTITY REQUIRED.	CLASS No. 11—HARNESS, LEATHER, SHOE FINDINGS, SADDLERY, ETC.—Continued. Deliverable packed in quantities as required.	QUANTITY OFFERED.	SAMPLES.							
			No. 1. Price.	No. 2. Price.	No. 3. Price.	No. 4. Price.	No. 5. Price.	No. 6. Price.		
2 galls.	Pegs, shoe, 7—10,									
12 no.	Pincers, lasting, steel, No. 4,		<i>No bid this year. Before we paid 50¢</i>							
9 no.	Planes, edge, sizes 4 to 12,	165								
27 no.	Punches, hand, oval, Nos. 1 to 14,		<i>No bid this year. Before we paid 65¢</i>							
63 no.	Punches, spring, harness, 6, 7, and 8 tube,	60								
21 no.	Rasps, peg (or peg break),	30								
57 no.	Rasps, shoe, 8-inch, regular,	15								
86 no.	Rasps, shoe, 10-inch, regular,	20								
97 lbs.	Rivets, hame, Norway, malleable, $\frac{3}{8}$ -inch,	06 $\frac{1}{2}$								
62 doz.	Rings, halter,	17								
40 doz.	Rings, harness, malleable iron, X. C., $\frac{3}{4}$ -inch.	02 $\frac{1}{2}$								
74 doz.	Rings, harness, malleable iron, X. C., $\frac{7}{8}$ -inch.	03 $\frac{1}{2}$								
91 doz.	Rings, harness, malleable iron, X. C., 1-inch.	03 $\frac{1}{2}$								
78 doz.	Rings, harness, malleable iron, X. C., 1 $\frac{1}{4}$ -inch.	05 $\frac{1}{2}$								
119 doz.	Rings, harness, malleable iron, X. C., 1 $\frac{1}{2}$ -inch.	07								
143 doz.	Rings, harness, malleable iron, X. C., 1 $\frac{3}{4}$ -inch.	08 $\frac{1}{2}$								
26 doz.	Rosettes, nickel plate, 1 $\frac{1}{2}$ -inch,	15								
24 doz.	Rosettes, nickel plate, 2-inch,	40								
20 no.	Rules, 3-foot, straight, boxwood,	90								
22 no.	Saddles,	220								
10 $\frac{1}{2}$ doz.	Sheepskins, for shoe linings, medium weight, pink and russet.	540 590								
75 doz.	Slides, breast-strap, 1 $\frac{1}{2}$ -inch, japanned,	22								
23 doz.	Slides, breast-strap, 1 $\frac{3}{4}$ -inch, japanned,	20								
12 doz.	Slides, breast-strap, 2-inch, japanned,	52								
12 gross	Snaps, harness, malleable iron, X. C., $\frac{3}{8}$ -inch.	156								
22 gross	Snaps, harness, malleable iron, X. C., 1-inch.	166								
4 gross	Snaps, harness, malleable iron, X. C., 1 $\frac{1}{4}$ -inch.	286								
16 gross	Snaps, harness, malleable iron, X. C., 1 $\frac{1}{2}$ -inch.	318								
13 doz.	Spots, silvered, 1-inch,	25								
19 doz.	Squares, hip-strap, $\frac{3}{8}$ -inch,	05								
105 doz.	Staples, hame, with burrs,	12								
17 no.	Stands, counter, regular, 4 lasts,	50								
1 no.	Stick, long,	<i>None wanted this year</i>								
1 no.	Stick, shoulder,							<i>In fact seldom called for</i>		

## SCHEDULE—Continued.

SAMPLES OF INFERIOR GOODS WILL NOT BE CONSIDERED.

E-506

QUANTITY REQUIRED.	CLASS No. 11—HARNESS, LEATHER, SHOE FINDINGS, SADDLERY, ETC.—Continued. Deliverable packed in quantities as required.	QUANTITY OFFERED.	SAMPLES.					
			No. 1. Price.	No. 2. Price.	No. 3. Price.	No. 4. Price.	No. 5. Price.	No. 6. Price.
6 no.	Sticks, size,	<i>No. bid. seldom accepted</i>						
16 pairs	Stirrups, wood, 5-inch,	<i>.13</i>						
4 no.	Stitching horses,	<i>2.00</i>						
92 no.	Stones, sand,	<i>0.23/4</i>						
7 no.	Stretchers, instep,	<i>No. Bid this year. Before we purchase</i>						
14 no.	Stretchers, toe,	<i>.75</i>						
18 no.	Sarcingles,	<i>1.25</i>						
3 doz.	Swivels, bridle, X. C., loop, 5/8-inch,	<i>0.7 1/2</i>						
3 doz.	Swivels, bridle, X. C., loop, 3/4-inch,	<i>0.7 1/2</i>						
415 lbs.	Tacks, shoe, 1, 2, and 3 ounce,	<i>11 10 08</i>						
6 1/2 doz.	Terrets, band, X. C., 1 1/2-inch,	<i>30</i>						
2 doz.	Terrets, band, X. C., 1 1/8-inch,	<i>33</i>						
115 lbs.	Thread, shoe, Barbour's, No. 3,	<i>9842</i>						
40 doz.	Thread, linen, spools, black, machine, Nos. 40 and 50.	<i>20 92 2 10 25</i>						
9 no.	Ticklers, creasing,	<i>40</i>						
3 no.	Ticklers, edge,	<i>45</i>						
7 no.	Tools, claw,	<i>45</i>						
42 doz.	Trace carriers, X. C.,	<i>24</i>						
24 no.	Trees, self-adjusting, X. C.,	<i>.22</i>						
102 lbs.	Wax, saddler's, black,	<i>0.4 1/2</i>						
2,020 balls	Wax, shoemaker's, black, small ball, per 100 balls.	<i>27 1/2</i>						
5 no.	Wheels, box, with slide,	<i>No. Bid this year.</i>						
1 no.	Wheel, fudge, none <i>same for</i>							
31 no.	Wheels, overstitch, with carriage, Nos. 6, 7, 8, 10, 12, and 14.	<i>65</i>						
19 doz.	Winkers, 3/4-inch, sensible, 2 seams, patent leather.	<i>1.45</i>						
ADDITIONAL ARTICLES.								
155 lbs.	Thread, shoe, Barbour's, No. 10,							
CLASS No. 12—AGRICULTURAL IMPLEMENTS, ETC.								
Deliverable packed in quantities as required.								
<small>Note.—Bids for machinery, samples of which are not furnished, must be accompanied by cuts and full descriptions, in duplicate, as to size, power, capacity, etc.</small>								
40 no.	Augers, post-hole, 9-inch,							
440 doz.	Axle grease (2 doz. boxes in case),							

89726

Indian Office,

1905